
Shelby County Schools

BID TABULATION

3135BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE: December 08, 2021

ITEM(S) QUOTED: Copy of CANNED AND POUCHED FRUITS & VEGS 

2021-2022 SY Jun 2021-Jan 2022 Canned and Pouched 

Fruits & Veg 

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: December 02, 2021

CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S): n/a 

COMMENTS: n/a 
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Vendor Response Terms

Response Payment TermsResponse TermsVendor Name

Atlantic Beverage Company

Bush Brothers & Company

Churchfield Trading Company

Red Gold, LLC Price quoted is for half truckload (22,500 

lbs/14 pallets) ship in full pallet quantity, load 

can be mixed items.

Net 30 days

Robbins Sales Company

Schreiber Foods International Net 30 days

Sysco Memphis, LLC. 2-3 week lead time- see notes on each item Net 14 days
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ITEM NO. 1   -  Fruit, Tropical Samples required. Fruit, Tropical - Packed to U.S. Grade B standard or better, 6/#10 cans/case, must 

contain pineapple, red papaya, and yellow papaya, can be packed in light syrup and/or natural fruit juice.  Minimum Drained Weight: 

72 oz.    Ship Lot: 476  Approved brands:  Dole - 38900 09082  Lolita  Port Royal 19211-53350  If any brand quoted other than these 

listed, please provide samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All samples need to be sent no later than November 23, 2021 by 

End of Business Day.    Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: Mabel Kwamusi  Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson 

Avenue  Memphis, TN 38112    1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 3,808 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

No Bid  #No Bid 1.0000Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: No Bid

No BidRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid

*DOLE  #9082 40.0000Sysco Memphis, LLC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4989604

Net 14 daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2-3 week lead time

Port Royal  41.9000Robbins Sales Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 19211-53350

ITEM NO. 2   -  Pineapple Chunks, Canned Pineapple Chunks, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade A standard, 6/#10 cans per case, 

packed in pineapple juice.  Minimum Drained Weight: 66 oz.    Ship Lot:  952    Approved brand:  Sunfield 1170/703070  Dole 00468  

Port Royal Premium 19211-57710  GFS Limson Trading Co. 114511  Del Monte 2001715   Our House OHP610   Stella 79543 00031    

If any brand quoted other than these listed, please provide samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All samples need to be sent 

no later than November 23, 2021 by End of Business Day.    Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: Mabel Kwamusi  

Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  Memphis, TN 38112  1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 4,760 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

No Bid  #No Bid 1.0000Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: No Bid

No BidRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid

*DEL MONTE  33.1700Churchfield Trading Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 2001715

Port Royal Premium  38.9400Robbins Sales Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 19211-57710

DOLE  #468 39.5000Sysco Memphis, LLC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4092334

Net 14daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2-3 week lead time

Ambrosia  42.8000Schreiber Foods International

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 19063

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Must order in FTL  (952cs) increments for this pricing.
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ITEM NO. 3   -  Greens, Turnip Samples required. Greens, Turnip - Packed to U.S. GRADE A standards, must be low sodium. Cut, 

minimum drained wt. 60 oz. Six cans per case.        Ship Lot: 476   Approved brands:  Allen 21213  Margaret Holmes 11252  

McCall 5TGBBB   If any brand quoted other than these listed, please provide samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All samples 

need to be sent no later than November 23, 2021 by End of Business Day.    Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: 

Mabel Kwamusi  Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  Memphis, TN 38112  1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 

4,760 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Mccalls  #21213 28.0900Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 21213

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: n/a

Margaret Holmes  28.9800Robbins Sales Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 11252

McCall- allens  #21213 30.5000Sysco Memphis, LLC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5616842

Net 14daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2-3 weeks lead time

MCCALLS  35.4100Churchfield Trading Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5TGBBB

ITEM NO. 4   -  Tomato Paste Samples required. Tomato Paste - Packed to U.S. Grade A standard, Approximate Bag Size: 115 

oz., #10 can equivalent pouches.    Ship Lot: 476   Approved brands:  Hunts 38837  Chef Johns 56356-00665  Contadina 2001796   

Red Gold UA 99   If any brand quoted other than these listed, please provide samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All samples 

need to be sent no later than November 23, 2021 by End of Business Day.    Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: 

Mabel Kwamusi  Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  Memphis, TN 38112  1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 

476 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

No Bid  #No Bid 1.0000Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: No Bid

No BidRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid

*Chef Johns  27.9000Robbins Sales Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 56356-00665

Red Gold LLC  #RPKUA99 28.7000Red Gold, LLC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: RPKUA99

Net 30 daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Price quoted is for half truckload (22,500 lbs/14 pallets) ship in full pallet quantity, load 

can be mixed items  -  .5 oz serving provides 1/4 cup R/O Vegetable credit

ITEM NO. 5   -  Salsa, Picante Sauce Samples required. Salsa/Picante Sauce  - A blend of tomatoes, onion, peppers and spices in 

a tomato sauce.  Mild in spice.  Approximate Pack: 6/#10 cans or 4/1 gallon jugs per case.  Ship Lot: 300    Rosarita 44300-10677  

Pace 489239  Casa Solana 485-4952-0211  Del Pasado 273275    If any brand quoted other than these listed, please provide 

samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All samples need to be sent no later than November 23, 2021 by End of Business Day.    

Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: Mabel Kwamusi  Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  Memphis, TN 

38112  1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 4,000 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

Campbells  #00067 37.7600Atlantic Beverage Company
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 00067

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: n/a

ITEM NO. 6   -  Cranberry Sauce, Jellied, Canned Samples required. Cranberry Sauce, Jellied, Canned.  Packed to U.S. Grade A 

standard, 6/#10 Cans per case.    Ship Lot: 150    Approved Brands:  Oregon Trail 4171261000  Clement 232079  GFS/Clement 

0100610  Ocean Spray 01400  Sysco Imperial 572996   If any brand quoted other than these listed, please provide samples of the 

brand that you are bidding.  All samples need to be sent no later than November 23, 2021 by End of Business Day.    Shelby 

County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: Mabel Kwamusi  Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  Memphis, TN 38112    1 - 

6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 476 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Neil Jones  #4171261000 46.4200Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4171261000

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: n/a

ITEM NO. 7   -  Whole Kernel Corn, Canned Samples required. Whole Kernel Corn, Canned - Golden Yellow. Low Sodium (below 

140mg), Packed to U.S. Grade B standards or better, 6/#10 cans/case. Minimum drained weight 68 oz. per can.    Ship Lot: 952   

Approved Brands:  Lakeside 7054  Allen/Happy Chef 70213   Allens 70217  Margaret Holmes 5COBBB  Del Monte 2004499  Our 

House OHWKC610  Ambrosia 26011    ChurchField NPC610      "If any brand quoted other than these listed, please provide 

samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All samples need to be sent no later than November 23, 2021 by End of Business Day.    

Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: Mabel Kwamusi  Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  Memphis, TN 

38112  "     1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 5,712 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Atlantic Beverage Company  #700084 26.4400Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 700084

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: n/a

OUR HOUSE  26.5000Churchfield Trading Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: OHWKC610

Lakeside/ Our House  28.9000Robbins Sales Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 7054

ITEM NO. 8   -  Sweet Potates, Canned Samples required. Sweet Potatoes, Canned - Fancy Cut packed in light syrup.  Sliced 

approx. 1 1/2"-2 1/2" across  and 3/4" to 1 1/4" thick. Packed to U.S. Grade A standard, 6 #10 cans/case.  Minimum Drained 

Weight: 73 oz.    Ship Lot: 476  Approved Brands:  Bruce 04441  Allen's Princella 08213  GFS/Moody Dunbar 796325      If any 

brand quoted other than these listed, please provide samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All samples need to be sent no later 

than November 23, 2021 by End of Business Day.    Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: Mabel Kwamusi  Reference 

Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  Memphis, TN 38112    1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 3,808 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Bruce  32.5000Robbins Sales Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 04441

Mcalls  #4441 34.9600Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 4441

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: n/a

MCALLS BRUCE  42.4700Churchfield Trading Company
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 04441

ITEM NO. 9   -  Tomatoes, Diced, No Added Salt Samples required. Tomatoes, Diced, No Added Salt, - Canned , packed to U.S. 

grade B standards or better. Packed: 6/#10 cans/case.  Must have 140mg of sodium or less per serving.    Ship Lot: 200.      Angela 

Mia 38067  Red Gold REDBQ9B  Furmano F11390   Red Gold REDBQ9B   If any brand quoted other than these listed, please 

provide samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All samples need to be sent no later than November 23, 2021 by End of 

Business Day.    Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: Mabel Kwamusi  Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  

Memphis, TN 38112  1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 476 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

No Bid  #No Bid 1.0000Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: No Bid

No BidRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid

*Red Gold LLC  #REDBQ9B 25.8400Red Gold, LLC

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: REDBQ9B

Net 30 daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Price quoted is for half truckload (22,500 lbs/14 pallets) ship in full pallet quantity, load 

can be mixed items  - 2.1 oz serving provides 1/4 cup R/O Vegetable credit

Conagra- Angela Mia  #38067 28.4300Sysco Memphis, LLC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3896446

Net 14daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2-3 weeks lead time 

ITEM NO. 10   -  Green Beans, Cut, Canned Samples required. Green Beans, Cut, Canned - Packed to U.S. Grade A standards.  

6/#10 cans per case. Approx. drained weight oz. per case           Ship Lot: 952   Approved Brands:  Monarch 1330158  

GFS/LAKESIDE 118737  LAKESIDE/PORT ROYAL 01316  Allen 1224  Sunfield 700200  Our House   Del Monte 01224  

McCall/Margaret Holmes 10727  Golden Harvest 19211-77707            Ship Lot: 952   If any brand quoted other than these listed, 

please provide samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All samples need to be sent no later than November 23, 2021 by End of 

Business Day.    Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: Mabel Kwamusi  Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  

Memphis, TN 38112  1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 2,856 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

No Bid  #No Bid 1.0000Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: No Bid

No BidRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: No Bid

*Golden Harvest  23.8800Robbins Sales Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 19211-77707

DEL MONTE  27.6000Churchfield Trading Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 01224

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: DEL MONTE CORRECT PC # IS 2004501 SEE NUTRITIONAL FOR CONFIRMATION 

ITEM NO. 11   -  Beans, Baked, Vegetarian, Canned Samples required. Beans, Baked, Vegetarian, Canned -  Packed to U.S. 

Grade A standard, 6 #10 cans/case, must be low sodium.  Minimum Drained Weight: 68 oz.    Ship Lot: 476     Approved brand:  

Bush 1638   If any brand quoted other than these listed, please provide samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All samples need 

to be sent no later than November 23, 2021 by End of Business Day.    Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  ATTN: Mabel 

Kwamusi  Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  Memphis, TN 38112  1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated Quantity - 3,808 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME
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*Bush Brothers  #1638 30.2400Bush Brothers & Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1638

Bush Brothers  #01638 31.0700Sysco Memphis, LLC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3560143

Net 14 daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 3 week lead time- drop ship minimum 336cs (14,500#)

Bush Brothers  #1638 31.5200Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1638

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: n/a

ITEM NO. 12   -  Beans, Black Taco Flvored Samples required. Beans, Black Taco Flavored– Dark, rich colored,  vegetarian Black 

beans in a taco flavored tomato sauce with corn.  Serving to equal ½ cup for the Child Nutrition Program. Canned - Packed to U.S. 

Grade A standards, must be low sodium.  6/#10 cans per case. Approx. drained weight 60oz. per can.    Ship Lot: 476   Approved 

brand:  Bush's 01585   If any brand quoted other than these listed, please provide samples of the brand that you are bidding.  All 

samples need to be sent no later than November 23, 2021 by End of Business Day.    Shelby County Schools-Nutrition Services  

ATTN: Mabel Kwamusi  Reference Bid # 3135  3176 Jackson Avenue  Memphis, TN 38112  1 - 6.0000 Each Case, Estimated 

Quantity - 3,808 

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

*Bush Brothers  #1585 35.4400Bush Brothers & Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1585

Bush Brothers  #01585 36.4400Sysco Memphis, LLC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 3560127

Net 14daysRESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 3 week lead time - Drop ship minimum 336cs(14,500#)

Bush Brothers  #1585 36.9200Atlantic Beverage Company

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 1585

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: n/a
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)

863,992.80  306,829.60Atlantic Beverage Company

250,109.44  250,109.44Bush Brothers & Company

718,360.16  157,889.20Churchfield Trading Company

25,961.04  12,299.84Red Gold, LLC

853,172.88  205,241.68Robbins Sales Company

203,728.00Schreiber Foods International

756,130.76  152,320.00Sysco Memphis, LLC.

1,084,689.76

8Note: * indicates an award. PAGE 


